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     Prof. Saadia S. Alam 

 ‘There is nothing permanent except Change.’ 

It has been my honor to be the 1st Female Chief Editor of Proceedings for a period of 8yrs from 
December 2017- April 2025 in its illustrious nearly four decades long history.  The 39(1) January to 
March 2025 Edition of Proceedings marks my last at its helm. Proceedings have been the flagship and 
custodian of academic research at SZMC and all over Pakistan. During my tenure a biannual 
Proceedings achieved regular unabated quarterly publications of 30 editions, totaling 317 articles 
across Pakistan from all medical and surgical disciplines vetted on HEC mandated strict criteria. With 
a unique focus on career building at Proceedings, no article processing fee was charged, enabling 
nearly 2219 mostly Pakistani researchers to present their scientific accomplishments to the world, 
fulfilling publication requirements of international standards for their promotions and without added 
financial stress. 

With focused intent, a revamped, able, and energetic Proceeding Team was developed which 
consistently worked with renewed vigor facing the elevated standards and challenges encompassing 
PMDC, HEC, CPSP, PASTIC Recognitions. Due to these efforts all were achieved including 4 years of 
HEC ‘Y’ Category Indexation till 2026 January. Our OJS supported Proceedings website established 
during the COVID lockdown, DOAJ Indexation, DOI Cross Ref registration & presence on Google 
Scholar being notable elements of Proceedings international visibility, connectivity & standards, 
Alhumdolillah. Furthermore, our path to Medline and Scopus and HEC W Category Indexations 
stands highlighted and ready for rejuvenated efforts and action. 

Our incoming Chief Editor Prof Ayesha Humayun shall now be in charge of all aspects of Proceedings 
Editions from formulation to production along with an Expansive Editorial Team beginning with the 
April to June 2025 Proceedings Edition. My oversight role has completed here. 

Proceedings of SZMC is rightfully considered a well established and reputed, stable, open access, peer 
reviewed Medical Journal by researchers of wide ranging medical and allied fields all over Pakistan. I 

pray that Proceedings continues to shine brightly in the domain of scientific journals into the future.         
Ameen sum Ameen 
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